

**LIMESTONE
TUSCARAWAS COUNTY
BID TABULATION
March 7, 2013**

Bidder	FOB Location	#1 or #2	#4	#8	#9 (grits)	#57	#304	#411	#617	Rip Rap
National L & S	Plant	15.50	15.50	15.50	No Bid	15.5	15.50	15.50	No Bid	32.50
	North	19.00	19.00	19.00	No Bid	19.00	19.00	19.00	No Bid	35.50
	South	19.50	19.50	19.50	No Bid	19.50	19.50	19.50	No Bid	37.50
Kimble C & L*	Plant	14.75	14.75	17.00	15.90	15.25	13.95	13.95	No Bid	21.50
	North	18.75	18.75	18.75	18.75	19.25	17.95	17.95	No Bid	25.50
	South	20.75	20.75	20.75	20.75	21.25	19.95	19.95	No Bid	27.50
Sidwell Standing Stone	Plant	10.40	10.40	11.50	No Bid	11.80	9.70	9.70	9.70	No Bid
	North	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	South	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Sidwell Apex Quarry	Plant	10.40	10.40	11.50	No Bid	11.80	9.70	9.70	9.70	14.60
	North	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	South	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Sidwell Midvale S & G	Plant	14.80	14.80	No Bid	No Bid	14.80	14.80	14.80	No Bid	No Bid
	North	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	South	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Stocker Concrete	Plant	23.50	23.50	23.50	No Bid	23.50	23.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	North	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	South	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

*Kimble Bid Sand Rock Type A Rip Rap (15.50 Plant, 19.50 North, 21.50 South) & Sand Rock Type B or C Rip Rap (14.50 Plant, 18.50 North, 20.50 South)
Award