

**SAND & GRAVEL  
TUSCARAWAS COUNTY  
BID TABULATION  
March 7, 2013**

**ALL PRICES FOB PLANT/TON**

<b>BIDDER</b>	<b>#8</b>	<b>#57</b>	<b>#304</b>	<b>SAND</b>	<b>#617</b>
Oster Sand & Gravel	8.50	9.25	9.00	3.50	No Bid
Kimble Clay & Limestone	10.45	12.45	No Bid	4.75	No Bid
Martin Quarry	7.80	11.00	12.00	3.00	12.00
Sidwell (Midvale S & G)	8.80	15.00	13.20	4.20	No Bid
Shelly Materials	13.50	13.05	13.25	5.70	13.25
Newton Asphalt Paving	9.75	12.50	12.50	3.50	No Bid
Stocker Sand & Gravel	14.00	16.00	No Bid	4.00	14.00
Phoenix Asphalt	7.00	12.50	8.75	3.00	7.00

Award to All Bidders – purchases per Road Breakdown