

READY-MIX CONCRETE
TUSCARAWAS COUNTY
BID TABULATION
March 6, 2014

Bidder	Class	Bid per CY SE Quadrant	Bid per CY SW Quadrant	Bid per CY NE Quadrant	Bid per CY NW Quadrant
Pleasant Valley Ready Mix	5 ½ bag mix	91.75	91.75	91.75	91.75
	6 bag mix	93.75	93.75	93.75	93.75
	6 ½ bag mix	95.75	95.75	95.75	95.75
	Add on charge for less than 5 yd load	50.00	50.00	50.00	50.00
	Class C-5000 psi with superplasticizer	-----	-----	103.00	-----
Smith Concrete	5 ½ bag mix	96.00	96.00	96.00	96.00
	6 bag mix	99.00	99.00	99.00	99.00
	6 ½ bag mix	102.00	102.00	102.00	102.00
	Add on charge for less than 5 yd load	50.00	50.00	50.00	50.00
	Class C-5000 psi with superplasticizer	-----	-----	108.00	-----
Stocker Concrete	5 ½ bag mix	95.50	95.50	99.50	99.50
	6 bag mix	98.00	98.00	102.00	102.00
	6 ½ bag mix	100.50	100.50	104.50	104.50
	Add on charge for less than 5 yd load	75.00	75.00	80.00	80.00
	Class C-5000 psi with superplasticizer	-----	-----	109.00	-----
Holmes Redimix	5 ½ bag mix	No bid	93.50	No bid	93.50
	6 bag mix	No bid	96.50	No bid	96.50
	6 ½ bag mix	No bid	99.50	No bid	99.50
	Add on charge for less than 5 yd load	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
	Class C-5000 psi with superplasticizer	-----	-----		-----

*Lowest Bid

*Second Lowest Bid