

**SAND & GRAVEL
TUSCARAWAS COUNTY
BID TABULATION
March 6, 2014**

ALL PRICES FOB PLANT/TON

BIDDER	#8	#57	#304	SAND	#617
Sidwell Material/Midvale Sand & Gravel	8.00	15.00	13.20	4.20	No bid
Martin Quarry/416 Sand & Gravel	8.75	12.50	13.00	3.50	13.00
Stocker Sand & Gravel	14.00	16.00	No bid	4.00	14.00
Soehnlén Brothers Sand & Gravel	6.80	10.00	No Bid	2.80	No bid
Shelly Materials	13.50	13.05	13.25	5.70	No bid
Oster Sand & Gravel	8.70	9.00	No bid	3.00	No bid
Newton Asphalt	10.00	13.00	No bid	4.00	No bid
Penn Ohio Coal/Kimble Clay & Limestone	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

*Awarded to all bidders – purchases per road breakdown