

TUSCARAWAS COUNTY ENGINEER
 BID TAB
 BITUMINOUS ASPHALT MATERIALS
 March 3, 2016

Bidders	CRS -2		HFRS-2		HFRS-2P		Permacoat 250	
	FOB Plant	FOB Tusc Co	FOB Plant	FOB Tusc Co	FOB Plant	FOB Tusc Co	FOB Plant	FOB Tusc Co
Asphalt Materials	1.65*	1.71**	1.65*	1.71**	1.95*	2.01*	2.95**	3.01*
Russell Standard Corp	1.756**	1.676*	1.756**	1.676*	2.156**	2.076**	No bid	No bid
Seaboard Asphalt Products Co.***	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	2.92*	3.50**

*Primary Award

**Secondary Award

***Note: Permacoat 250 "alternative" material bid – known as "Bond-X Liquid Binder" and not as specified