

TUSCARAWAS COUNTY ENGINEER
 BID TAB
 BITUMINOUS ASPHALT MATERIALS
 March 4, 2020

Bidders	CRS -2		HFRS-2		HFRS-2P		Permacoat 250	
	FOB Plant	FOB Tusc Co	FOB Plant	FOB Tusc Co	FOB Plant	FOB Tusc Co	FOB Plant	FOB Tusc Co
Asphalt Materials, Inc.*	1.81	1.931	1.81	1.931	2.10	2.221	3.20	3.321
Russell Standard Corp.**	1.87	1.98	1.87	1.98	2.16	2.27	3.21	3.35
Seaboard Asphalt Products Company***	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.85	3.26

*Primary Award
 **Secondary Award
 ***Tertiary Award