

READY-MIX CONCRETE
TUSCARAWAS COUNTY
BID TABULATION
March 6, 2019

Bidder	Class	Bid per CY SE Quadrant	Bid per CY SW Quadrant	Bid per CY NE Quadrant	Bid per CY NW Quadrant
Pleasant Valley Ready Mix	5 ½ bag mix	111.00	111.00	111.00	111.00
	6 bag mix	114.00	114.00	114.00	114.00
	6 ½ bag mix	116.00	116.00	116.00	116.00
	Add on charge for less than 5 yd load	50.00	50.00	50.00	50.00
	Class C-5000 psi with superplasticizer	-----	-----	126.00	-----
Stocker Concrete	5 ½ bag mix	114.50	123.50	125.50	126.50
	6 bag mix	117.00	127.00	129.50	130.00
	6 ½ bag mix	119.00	130.50	132.50	133.50
	Add on charge for less than 5 yd load	75.00	75.00	95.00	95.00
	Class C-5000 psi with superplasticizer	-----	-----	130.00	-----
Holmes Redimix	5 ½ bag mix	No Bid	121.00	No Bid	121.00
	6 bag mix	No Bid	122.00	No Bid	122.00
	6 ½ bag mix	No Bid	124.00	No Bid	124.00
	Add on charge for less than 5 yd load	No Bid	75.00	No Bid	75.00
	Class C-5000 psi with superplasticizer	-----	-----	No Bid	-----
Smith Concrete	5 ½ bag mix	123.00	123.00	123.00	123.00
	6 bag mix	126.00	126.00	126.00	126.00
	6 ½ bag mix	129.00	129.00	129.00	129.00
	Add on charge for less than 5 yd load	1-1.75 = \$110 2-2.75 = \$85 3-3.75 = \$60	1-1.75 = \$110 2-2.75 = \$85 3-3.75 = \$60	1-1.75 = \$110 2-2.75 = \$85 3-3.75 = \$60	1-1.75 = \$110 2-2.75 = \$85 3-3.75 = \$60
	Class C-5000 psi with superplasticizer	-----	-----	138.00	-----

Lowest Bid Second Lowest Bid Third Lowest Bid
Award to all bidders