

**SAND & GRAVEL
TUSCARAWAS COUNTY
BID TABULATION
March 4, 2020**

ALL PRICES FOB PLANT/TON

BIDDER	#8	#57	#304	SAND	#617
Razor Lake Materials, Inc.	9.00	14.00	No Bid	4.00	No Bid
Clark Clay Co.	10.00	15.00	10.00	4.50	No Bid
Sidwell Materials/Midvale S & G	9.25	21.75	16.45	5.30	No Bid
Newton Asphalt	12.50	17.00	No Bid	5.50	No Bid
Soehnlén Brother Sand & Gravel	10.20	14.20	No Bid	4.80	No Bid
Green Dream Int'l/Feikert S & G	9.45	18.90	13.65	No Bid	No Bid
Oster Sand & Gravel	16.00	16.50	16.00	6.00	No Bid
Stocker Sand & Gravel	21.00	21.00	No Bid	9.00	No Bid

*Award to all bidders